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It is now over twenty-five years since the introduc­
tion of intensive short-term courses in prosthetics and 
orthotics at New York University, Northwestern, and 
the University of California at Los Angeles. These con­
densed courses have benefitted every practitioner, not 
only in his practical approach to patient management, 
but also in his inter-relationship with his peers through 
a unified and common language that we call "nomen­
clature." In countless cases, these formal educational 
courses have served as a springboard to successful com­
pletion of the certification examination. 

It was the Veterans Administration which at that 
time took the primary responsibility of disseminating 
and funding prosthetic research programs. Their Clin­
ic Team approach became very popular, leading to the 
simultaneous education of physicians, therapists and 
prosthetists/orthotists. Undoubtedly, this close rela­
tionship of the three disciplines, working together for 
one common goal, namely, the rehabilitation of the 
disabled, has narrowed a gap that formerly was all too 
visible. I feel it has also helped to lift the field of pros­
thetics and orthotics out of the dark age, out of its sole 
"craftsmanship concept" into the more comprehensive 
classification of "professionalism"—all in all, an ap­
propriate tribute that was long overdue. 

Every prosthetist/orthotist, having successfully com­
pleted these short-term courses, came out a better per­
son, a better clinician. The physician and therapist, by 
the same token, gained insight into our field as never 
before. Now all three disciplines in their deliberations 
at clinic meetings spoke at the same level through a 
unified language, and intelligent solutions were ar­
rived at by understanding the underlying problems. 

A by-product of this progressive and noteworthy ap­
proach was the respect the prosthetic/orthotic practi­
tioner gained from the medical and paramedical pro­
fessions, once his continued striving for excellence in 
performance and elevation of standards was realized 
by them. This respect, however, was not attained very 
easily. In our quest for sharing the knowledge and in­
sight into our field with the physician and therapist, 

we also committed a monumental mistake—making 
them experts in the fitting, alignment and fabrication 
of every prosthetic/orthotic device there is. Without 
realizing it at the time, we gave into their hands a 
powerful tool, even further, a most powerful weapon 
—the check-out sheet!!! 

There, in black and white, we developed a question­
naire telling them exactly how to pick a device apart, 
piece by piece, making them the sole, omnipotent 
judge of whether to pass or fail it. By setting up this 
systematic method of examining our devices we have 
admitted that one cannot trust our professional judg­
ment or technical expertise. I know of no other group 
in the health care profession that has so mindlessly re­
linquished its professional prerogatives and intricate 
understanding of a subject to another discipline, with 
certainly less knowledge of the particular subject, for 
its scrutiny. Even today, after 25 years of continuous 
upgrading, we sheepishly subject ourselves to this pro­
cedure. This permits even a therapist fresh out of 
school, but equipped with a check-out sheet, to sud­
denly become powerful and to be feared for his or her 
"judgment" when check-out day rolls around. Count­
less man-hours and precious components and materials 
have been wasted when physician and therapist could 
not see eye-to-eye with the prosthetist/orthotist on 
alignment, fitting and finishing procedures. A device 
often had to be altered, sometimes even done over en­
tirely, for rather trivial reasons, not to mention the im­
mense damage inflicted on the patient-prosthetist/or-
thotist relationship when these so-called "problems" 
were hashed out in the open, for everyone to hear, 
rather than in a more private setting. 

There is no doubt in my mind that the level of edu­
cation and the competence of every prosthetist/orthot­
ist has risen tremendously in the last two and one-half 
decades, especially for one who takes advantage of the 
continued education process. He is a better person 
than he was 25 years ago, and his knowledge of the 
subject, "Prosthetics and Orthotics," is vastly greater 
than that of a physician or therapist. He is a profes­
sional who will, without complaint, work his way 



around a poorly-amputated limb that may not be to 
his liking for fitting purposes and come up with a func­
tional prosthetic device without asking the surgeon for 
a revision. He will produce an adequate prosthetic de­
vice despite flexion contractures and edema, due to in­
sufficient exercise and lack of proper stump-wrapping. 

Nobody denies the need for a check-out after a pros­
thetic/orthotic device has been completed. But yester­
day's check-out sheet should be scrapped in its entirety 
—the sooner the better—and replaced with one con­
sisting of only three questions: 

1. Is the prosthesis/orthosis as prescribed? 
2. Is the patient comfortable? 

3. Is the prosthesis/orthosis functional? 
The above criteria should more than satisfy any physi­
cian or therapist. 

The decision as to pleasing cosmetic appearance, in­
sofar as possible, should be left to the patient. 

The decision on whether or not accepted standards 
and principles have been met in the fitting, alignment 
and fabrication of the device, should be entirely that 
of the prosthetist/orthotist. 

The field of prosthetics and orthotics has come of 
age; so have its practitioners. The check-out sheet has 
not kept pace with changing times and should be abol­
ished in its present form. 


